
The 2022 edition of Fedrigoni 365 follows on from the very 
topical theme of collaboration and inclusion, but with a 
difference: this year’s Fedrigoni 365 is the product of artists 
from different disciplines and prestigious creative-printing 
partners, culminating in a true celebration of the creative 
eco-system in its entirety. This unique, multi-faceted partnership 
has produced a calendar that serves as an educational toolkit 
and source of inspiration for new designers, showcasing the 
endless possibilities of finishing and book binding.

Danny McNeil, Creative Director and Founder, TM, commented: 
“In a world where we have found ourselves working from home 
and communicating through digital devices, Fedrigoni 365 2022 
serves as a timely reminder of the tangible, the power of the 
printed page and the value of collaboration.”

Instead of presenting itself as a single-bound book, this year’s 
calendar is a collection of four volumes. Each is produced using 
various hues of Fedrigoni’s Materica paper, a range of finishing 
techniques, and are singularly printed by four leading printers - 
serving as a fundamental asset for designers on the wonders of 
printing. As with previous editions, hundreds of creatives, from 
designers to illustrators and photographers, were invited to 
submit a numeric design for an assigned date.

365   //  2022

December 1st
-
World Aids Day. Continuing to raise 
awareness and support in the fight against 
a pandemic that is not gone away.


